5.1.2 NON GOVERNMENT SCHOLARSHIP 2019-20

BLUESTAR SCHOLARSHEEP

amount(50% of

srno |[roll no|Class Name fees)
1| 8150|BE ELEX |KAMAT YASHWANT RAJAN 70000
2| 7813|BE PROD |GUPTA SHRIRAM BHALLAR 63000
3| 8237|TE PROD |TUSHAR PRASHANT SHARMA 70000
4| 8451|TE PROD [PRATIK UDDHAV TARADE 70000
5 8282|TE ELEX |ASHSIH KUMAR 70000
6| 8251|SE PROD |PUNJABI ADITYA PRADEEP 70000
7| 8498|SE PROD |DUBEY AMIT RADHESHYAM 70000
4,83,000/-
STULZ-CHSPL Scholarship
srno |roll no|Class Name amount
1| 8498|SE PROD |DUBEY AMIT RADHESHYAM 70000
SHAIKH MOHAMMAD SULTAN MOHAMMAD
2| 7844|BE PROD |[MUSTAFA 70000
3| 8630|SE COMP |PUROHIT SURYAWANSH BHUPESH 70000
4| 8640|SE COMP|SHETTY SANATH KRISHNA 60000
5| 8696|SE IT SHAH DHRUMIL JIGNESH 60000
TE

6| 8284 |TELEX KUMAR YASH RAMESH 60000

8212|TE PROD |MANOTI HARSHAVARDHAN PUSHPARAJ 60000
8| 8631|SE COMP|REDDY GANESH BHEEMESH 50000




MOHAN T ADVANI

CENTENNIAL SCHOLARSHIPS

FRUNDATION

-~ December 09, 2019

To

Dr Srija Unnikrishnan

Principal

Fr Conceicao Rodrigues College of Engineering
Bandra (W), Mumbai- 400050.

Subiject: Mohan T Advani Centennial Scholarships by Blue Star Founda ion
Dear Dr Srija,
With respect to our earlier communication on the subject, the below listed 3 students out of your

recommended candidates have been selected for the Mohan T Advani Centennial scholarships by Blue
Star Foundation, post face-to-face interviews with our selection board.

of

1. Mr Amit Dubey (Production)
2. Mr Aditya Punjabi (Production)

As you are aware, the scholarship programme comprises a monetary support of half of the tuition fees
for SYBE. We extend a support of Rs 1,40,000 towards half of the fees of these 2 students. We intend to
support these students for the rest of the degree course, subject to their academic performance. Also, we
support with an amount of Rs 2,10,000 towards half the tuition fee for 3 students of TYBE, namely
Mr Tushar Sharma, Mr Pratik Tarade and Mr Ashish Kumar, and Rs 1,33,000 towards the 2 FYBE students,
namely, Mr Shriram Gupta and Mr Yashwant Kamat. Cheque no. 000334 for Rs 4,83,000 dated
November 26, 2019 in the name of ‘Society of St Francis Xavier, Pilar’ is attached herewith.

despite challenging personal circumstances. A sp ial thanks to you and Prof Sundary for your

We appreciate the commitment of these students to?e:#iapihg themselves with a professional degree,
whole-hearted support in this endeavour.

s {
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Sudakshina Ray
Honorary Secretary
Blue Star Foundation

Mohan T Advani Centennial Scholarships, C/o Blue Star Foundation, Kasturi Buildings, Mohan T Advani Chowk
Jamshediji Tata Road, Mumbal 400 020, India. T : +91 22 66654000 F : +91 226665 4151

Blue Star Foundation is registered under Bombay Public Trust Act, 1950. Regn. No, E-9184 Mumoal




yogita CRCE <yogita@fragnel.edu.in>

_wd: Mohan T Advani Centennial ( 2019

V " prabavarthy CRCE <prabavarthy@fragnel.edu.in> Fri, Aug 23, 2019 at 12:45 PM

To: yogita <yogita@frcrce.ac.in>

9

- Forwarded message
From: prabavarthy CRCE <prabavarthy@fragnel.edu.in>
Date: Thursday, August 22, 2019

Subject: Mohan T Advani Centennial Scholarships 2019
To: Sudakshina Ray <Sudakshinaray@bluestarindia.com>

Good morning.Received the 4 envelopes containing the cheques & certificates which you had sent to me
today.! will hand over the same to the respective students. i will send you the result analysis&Fees
break up details asap.Also,| will start the process for the next batch of students from Monday. With
regards&thanks : SUNDARY.

On Wednesday, August 21, 2019, Sudakshina Ray <Sudakshinaray@bluestarindia.com> wrote:
Dear Dr Srija & Prof Sundary,

I hope you are doing well! but T am writing this mail on the Mohan T Advani Centennial
Scholarships for 2019.

Please share the results of all the scholarship holders please, for the respective
semesters. The scholarship programme will be continued for the present final year BE
and the TYBE students, based on results last received. Please let us have the fee break-

up for Year II, III and 1IV. | (TZE'L
FINIE

ORI BY

1 S1G. ¢
- - We intend to offer scholarships to 2 new SJB‘Estudents”thiS"year'and hence invite 4

applications from your college for panel interviews at our end.

Please find attached the note of scholarships as well as the scholarship application

form, to be circulated to the interested students please.

I will be sending across the scholarship posters to you shortly. Look forward to hearing from you
on this.

Thank you.

Regards,
Sudakshina



SOCIETY OF ST. FRANCIS XAVIER, PILAR'S

FR. CONCEICAO RODRIGUES COLLEGE OF ENGINEERING

(Approved by AICTE & Affiliated to Universily of Mumbar)

Fr. Agnel Ashram, Bandstand, Bandra (W), Mumbai - 400 050.
Phone : (022) 6711 4000. 67114101, 6711 4104 = Fax . 6711 4100
Website ' www.frcrce.acin - » Email | cree@fragnel.edu.in

Ref: SFX 120191/ 340 Date: 14/11/2019.
To,
M/s. Blue Star India
MUMBAL
INVOICE
Sub.: Scholarship for the Academic Year 2019-20
r Y ¥ —
50% of College
| s.No. 1 Roll No. Class ! Name of the student fees (Rs.)
1 | 8150 BE Elex | Kamat Yashwant Rajan 70,000/~
2 | 7813 BE Prod | Gupta Shriram Bhallar 63,000/
3 8237 TE Prod Tushar Prashant Sharma 70,000/-
4 8451 TE Prod Pratik Uddhav Tarade 70,000/-
5 8282 TE Elex | Ashish Kumar 70,000/-
6 8521 SE Prod Punjabi Aditya Pradeep 70,000/-
7 8498 SE Prod | Dubey Amit Radheshyam 70,000/~
| | TOTAL 4,83,000/-

(Rupees Four lakh Eighty Three Thousand Only)

PAN No. of the Society / Trust is AABTS 9182Q and
GST Registration No.27AABTS9182Q1ZI

The details of Bank Account to make NEFT / RTGS Payment is as follows -

Name of the Account ! Society of St. Francis Xavier, Pilar
Name of the Bank 3 Corporation Bank
Name of the Branch ! 0120, Bandra (W), Mumbai — 50.
NEFT / IFSC Code No. ; CORP0000120
9 Digit MICR Code appearingon 400017003
the Cheque Book
Account No. 2 520141000955503
1
/

€

R
e

(FR. VALERIAN D'SOUZA)
DIRECTOR




Amount pai

FR. CONCEICAO l"WDRIGUES COLLEGE OF ENGIN|gRING
Fr. Agnel Ashram, Bandra (West), Mumbai - 400 050

d towards Scholarship received from M/s Stulz-CHSPL (Inida) Pvt.Ltd towards poor & needy students

Sr. | Roll Amount of Adjusted Ch. No. Net Amount
No.| No. Noms Class | scholarship | against Fees __Payable |
1 | 8498 |DUBEY AMIT RADHESHYAM SE-PROD 70,000.00 0.00| 352601 70,000.00

SHAIKH MOHAMMED SULTAN 0.00
2 | 7844 |\ AMMED MUSTAFA BE-PROD 70,000.00 70,000.00 ]
PUROHIT SURYANSH
3 | 8630 |5 pESH SE-COM 70,000.00 0.00| 352602 ~70,000.00
4 | 8640 [SHETTY SANATH KRISHNA SE-COM 60,000.00 60,000.00 0.00
5 | 8696 |SHAH DHRUMIL JIGNESH SE-IT 60,000.00 0.00| 352603 ¥60,000.00
6 | 8284 |KUMAR YASH RAMESH TE-ELEX 60,000.00 60,000.00 0.00
MANOTI HARSHAVARDHAN
7| 6212 Ta Bakay TE-PROD 60,000.00 60,000.00 0.00
8 | 8631 |REDDY GANESH BHEEMESH | SE-COM 50,000.00 50,000.00 0.00
TOTAL _ | .&8:00,000.00 3,00,000.00 2,00,000.00
TCRECKED BY
‘ .‘-Hqt!\‘Al,AAAH)ll

PRINCIPAL




STULZ - CHSPL FOUNDATION

A-173 & 17VLTTC bedl Ares, Khalrae MIDC, OFF, Thase-Belsper Ré, Koparkhairne, Navi Mambei 300710,
Tel - +91 79069255404 1. CIN; URMOFM H20 I ONPLII95ES.

Date: 19 August, 2019

To,

Dr. Sapna Prabhu,
Dean Academics,
FRCRCE,
Bandra.

Dear Madam,

Enclosed please find the cheques issued for the below mentioned students,

Sr. Amount | Cheque | Cheque
Name Class
 No. (Rs.) No. pate | Bahk
1 | Amit Dubey SE (Production) | 70,000« | 000056 | 1682019 | Kotak
7 |sulanshaikh | BE(Production) £ 70000 | 000057 [ 1682019 | Kotak
3 | Suryansh Purahit | S.E (Computer) 70000 | 000058 | 1682019 | Kotak
4 | SanathShetty SE(Computer) |<60,000 | 000059 | 1682019 | Kotak |
5 | Dhrumil Shah SE(IT) ¥60000 | 000060 | 16.8.2019 | Kotak |
6 | Kumar Yash T.E (Electronics) |< 60,000 | 000061 | 1682019 | Kotak
Harshawardhan e
7 T.E (Production) 760000 | 000062 | 1682019 | Kotak
Manoti .
A
8 | Ganesh Reddy SE(Computer)  [¢ 50,000 | 000063 | 1682019 | Katak
L /5,00,000

Requesting you ta issue the recelpt in the name of STULZ ~CHSPL FOUNDATION.

TR Y

Thanking You, | FITELNAL AL |,” 4}
' g -

7 M-

For STULZ ~-CHSPL FOUNDATION

it A7
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